
The Lord is in his holy temple; let all the earth keep 
silence before him. ~ Habakkuk 2:20 
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The stone that the builders rejected 

has become the cornerstone. ~ Psalm 118:22 
 

 

Call to Worship: The King 
summons us to assemble 
before his throne in worship 
and adoration of Him. 

Invocation: We worship our 
Creator and Covenant Lord, 
the all-sufficient God. 

Greeting: God welcomes his 
people with a blessing. 

We pray to God to bless our 
worship service, that it will be 
pleasing and acceptable to 
Him. 

We burst into a “sacrifice of 
thanksgiving” through song. 

We read God’s Law each 
Lord’s Day to remind us of 
God’s rule, convict us of sin 
and our need for confession, 
and prepare us for the 
hearing of the gospel. 

After the Law exposes our 
sins, we confess and repent 
before God. 

After confession, God dec-
lares us pardoned through 
Christ who made perfect 
satisfaction for our sins. 

In song, we thank God for his 
grace and mercy in saving us 
from sin. 

The reading from one of our 
creeds or confessions 
defines who we are, shows 
our unity with the universal 
church through the ages and 
across the world, and 
reminds us of our core 
doctrines. 

 

 

The minister prays to God on 
behalf of the people, the 
people joining in silence. He 
gives thanks for all that God 
has done; seeks God’s help 
for the church's many bur-
dens; and seeks the Spirit’s 
help in his preaching. 

Our offerings to the Lord to 
show thankfulness to God for 
His salvation and abundant 
gifts to us. 

Scripture is the principal 
means of grace and the infal-
lible foundation of preaching. 

The preaching of God's 
Word by God’s ordained 
servants is the central part of 
the worship service. 

The Lord’s Supper (1st 
Sunday) is a communion and 
remembrance of Christ’s 
body broken and blood shed 
on the cross for our sins. 

In song, we offer our lives as 
living sacrifices to God, know-
ing that the Spirit helps us. 

Benediction: The minister 
pronounces God’s blessing 
on the people as they are sent 
out into the world refreshed, 
and with joy. The Triune God 
promises to be with us 
throughout the week, to bless, 
comfort and protect us. 

Doxology: A final response 
of faith to the Word, giving 
glory to God for all we have 
heard, seen and received in 
worship. 


